ROCK COUNTY, WISCONSIN PURCHASING DIVISION
FINANCIAL SERVICES

BID SUMMARY FORM

BID NUMBER #2021-27
BID NAME JAIL AND CORRECTIONAL PRODUCTS
DEPARTMENT SHERIFF’S OFFICE
BID DUE DATE October 6, 2021 — 1:30 P.M.

PRODUCT UOM | UNIFORM MFG | VICTORY SUPPLY LLC CHARMTEX ACME SUPPLY ICS JAIL SUPPLIES

PHOENIX AZ MOUNT PLEASANT TN | BROOKLYN NY GLEN COVE NY WACO TX

INMATE SHIRTS SIZES S-L EA 5.51 5.51 6.54 6.50 10.95
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE XL EA 5.51 5.51 6.54 6.50 10.95
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE 2XL EA 5.51 5.51 6.54 6.50 11.11
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE 3XL EA 5.79 5.74 6.72 6.50 12.16
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE 4XL EA 5.79 5.74 6.90 6.50 12.48
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE 5XL EA 6.08 6.08 7.18 6.50 12.80
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE 6XL EA 6.08 6.21 7.54 6.50 13.95
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE 7XL EA 6.39 6.21 7.72 6.50 14.28
INMATE SHIRTS SIZE 8XL EA 6.39 6.21 7.90 6.50 14.44
T-SHIRTS SIZES S-L DZ 44.23 25.94 29.90 60.00 56.11
T-SHIRTS SIZE XL DZ 44.23 25.94 29.90 60.00 56.11
T-SHIRTS SIZE 2XL DZ 47.13 34.74 45.90 60.00 59.44
T-SHIRTS SIZE 3XL DZ 50.03 36.97 47.90 60.00 64.06
T-SHIRTS SIZE 4XL DZ 53.65 39.75 47.90 60.00 68.23
T-SHIRTS SIZE 5XL DZ 58.73 40.95 47.90 60.00 74.06
T-SHIRTS SIZE 6XL DZ 63.08 41.95 49.90 60.00 79.06
T-SHIRTS SIZE 7XL DZ 155.15 108.00 49.90 60.00 106.56
T-SHIRTS SIZE 8XL DZ 166.75 108.00 136.90 60.00 111.56
TROUSERS SIZES S-L EA 6.33 6.11 7.36 7.00 12.90
TROUSERS SIZE XL EA 6.33 6.11 7.36 7.00 12.90
TROUSERS SIZE 2XL EA 6.33 6.11 7.36 7.00 13.06
TROUSERS SIZE 3XL EA 6.50 6.34 7.54 7.00 14.31
TROUSERS SIZE 4XL EA 6.50 6.44 7.90 7.00 14.63
TROUSERS SIZE 5XL EA 6.83 6.74 7.90 7.00 14.95
TROUSERS SIZE 6XL EA 6.83 6.82 8.18 7.00 16.32
TROUSERS SIZE 7XL EA 7.18 6.82 8.54 7.00 16.64
TROUSERS SIZE 8XL EA 7.18 6.82 8.90 7.00 16.80




PRODUCT UOM | UNIFORM MFG | VICTORY SUPPLY LLC | CHARMTEX | ACME SUPPLY | ICSJAIL SUPPLIES
PHOENIX AZ MOUNT PLEASANT TN BROOKLYN NY GLEN COVE NY WACO TX
PANTIES SIZES 6-12 DOZ 16.32 8.44 (6-9 sz) 8.18 15.00 21.23
8.97 (10-12 sz)
SPORTS BRAS SIZES 32-52 DOZ 29.37 17.24 (32-42 s2) 23.89 24.00 41.87
18.34 (44-52 s2)
BOXERS SIZES SMALL-6XL DOZ 26.83 14.66 (s-xI) 14.90 18 30.76
14.87 (2xI)
15.24 (3x)
15.64 (4x)
15.00 (5xI)
SPORTS SOCKS DOZ 7.10 5.67 6.89 NOBID | 230.97 (CASE 20 D2)
FOOTWEAR SIZES 5-15 DOZ NO BID 4.44 (PR) 59.90 NO BID 8.87
MATTRESS EA NO BID 59.77 61.90 NO BID 62.69
ISOLATION/SUICIDE SMOCK EA NO BID 61.77 73.99 NO BID 81.27
ISOLATION/SUICIDE CELL BLANKET | EA NO BID 61.77 71.99 NO BID 82.74
PROTECTIVE DETAINEE HOOD EA NO BID 3.75 29.90 (CS) NOBID | 464.62 (CASE OF 40)
BIC SINGLE BLADE RAZORS CASE NO BID 97.84 87.90 NO BID | 106.03 (CASE OF 720)

Invitation to Bid was advertised in the Janesville Gazette and in the Internet. One additional vendor was solicited that did not respond.

PREPARED BY:

SHILO TITUS, PURCHASING MANAGER

DEPARTMENT HEAD RECOMMENDAT

ION:

ALL CLOTHING — VICTORY SUPPLY LLC

FOOTWEAR, MATTRESSES, ISOLATION SMOCKS & BLANKETS, PROTECTIVE DETAINEE HOODS — VICTORY SUPPLY LLC

RAZORS — CHARMTEX

SIGNATURE

GOVERNING COMMITTEE APPROVAL:

DATE

CHAIR

VOTE

DATE




