
ROCK COUNTY, WISCONSIN       PURCHASING DIVISION 
FINANCE DIRECTOR       

 

 
 
 
 
 

BID SUMMARY FORM 
 

PROJECT NUMBER  #2021-28 
PROJECT NAME  DISPOSABLE NITRILE EXAM GLOVES 
PROJECT DUE DATE October 7, 2021 – 1:30 P.M. 
DEPARTMENT  ROCK HAVEN  
 
 

COMPANY NAME 
SIGNED  

ADDENDA SAMPLE SMALL MEDIUM LARGE 
X-

LARGE 

              

SHAMROCK MANUFACTURING COMPANY Y Y $6.30 $6.30 $6.30 $6.30 

FRONTLINE GROUP LLC Y Y $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 

PENGYING TRADING INC N Y $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 

INDO TRADING LLC  N Y $6.80 $6.80 $6.80 $6.80 

MERSI DISTRIBUTION  Y Y $6.89 $6.89 $6.89 $6.89 

SUNLINE SUPPLY N Y $7.25 $7.25 $7.25 $7.25 

TEXAS MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY Y Y $7.50 $7.50 $7.50 $7.50 

ZINNTEX LLC Y Y $7.95 $7.95 $7.95 $7.95 

WMEDICA  Y Y $7.99 $7.99 $7.99 $7.99 

AMRAPUR OVERSEAS INC N Y $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 

NORFLEET DISTRIBUTORS Y N $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 

D'S VENTURES  N N $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 

PODS USA N Y $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 

RB SIGMA LLC N Y $8.40 $8.40 $8.40 no bid 

JNR HEALTH & WELLNESS N Y $8.50 $8.50 $8.50 $8.50 

LUBEMATRIX Y Y $8.75 $8.75 $8.75 $8.75 

MINI WING USA N Y $8.75 $8.75 $8.75 $8.75 

MEDISCA INC Y Y $8.99 $8.99 $8.99 $8.99 

APEX OMNISOURCE, LLC N Y $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 

BATHURST 1816 LLC N N $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 

ACTONE GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS INC Y Y $9.18 $9.18 $9.18 $9.18 

MEDASERV N Y $9.40 $9.40 $9.40 $9.40 

SANITIZENOW  Y Y $9.43 $9.43 $9.43 $9.43 

QYK BRANDS LLC Y Y $9.60 $9.60 $9.60 $9.60 

UNIPAK CORP  Y Y $9.95 $9.95 $9.95 $9.95 

MEDICAPPE INC  Y Y $10.25 $10.25 $10.25 $10.25 

UNIPAK CORP  N Y $10.25 $10.25 $10.25 $10.25 

SCHOOL HEALTH CORPORATION N Y $10.29 $10.29 $10.29 $10.29 

 



VIZOCOM N Y $10.80 $10.80 $10.80 $10.80 

SERVANT HEALTH N N $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 

HEALTHY SCHOOL SUPPLIES LLC Y Y $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 

INTERBORO PACKAGING  N Y $11.80 $11.80 $11.80 $11.80 

CLEAN SPACE PROJECT Y Y $11.89 $11.89 $11.89 $11.89 

MALOR AND COMPANY INC Y Y $12.17 $12.17 $12.17 $12.17 

WURTH WOOD GROUP INC  N Y $12.42 $12.42 $12.42 $12.42 

KUJO LLC Y Y $12.85 $12.85 $12.85 $12.85 

PACIFIC BRIDGE SOURCING MANAGEMENT Y Y $13.45 $13.45 $13.45 $13.45 

LFB3 LLC Y Y $13.48 $13.48 $13.48 $13.48 

PACIFIC LINK INTERNATIONAL CORP Y Y $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 

PACIFIC LINK INTERNATIONAL CORP N Y $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 

ALL STATES MED  N Y $14.00 $14.00 $14.00 $14.00 

LANDMARK SUPPLY INC N Y $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 

MEDZON N Y $16.90 $16.90 $16.90 $16.90 

IREMEDY HEALTHCARE INC N Y $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 

FLINN SCIENTIFIC INC N Y $19.20 $19.20 $19.20 $19.20 

NCI CLEAN N N $20.50 no bid no bid no bid 

GENTOX MEDICAL SERVICES Y Y $21.50 $21.50 $21.50 $21.50 

LAWSON PRODUCTS INC Y Y no bid $14.00 $14.00 $14.00 
 

Invitation to Bid was advertised in the Janesville Gazette. 
 
PREPARED BY:  SHILO TITUS, PURCHASING MANAGER      
 
DEPARTMENT HEAD RECOMMENDATION:          
 
                
Signature             Date 
 
GOVERNING COMMITTEE APPROVAL: 
 
                
Chair           Vote   Date 
 


